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Objectives
The course aims at developing the knowledge and competence in assessment, grades 
and systematic quality activities for professional work in pre-school class, extended 
school and primary school years 1-6. 
 
After completing the course, students shall be able to:

construct and critically review learning situations, assessment situations and 
examinations with formative as well as summative purposes.

•

describe, analyse, assess and grade pupils' learning and development.•
critically review and problematize assessment and grading on the basis of 
various social factors as well as ethical aspects such as diversity and gender.

•

account for the basis, importance and function of the quality work in extended 
schools, primary schools and in society.

•

independently plan, document, follow up and evaluate educational work on the •



basis of the principles of systematic quality work.

Content
The course discusses the school system's assessment and grading system in a historical, 
societal and international perspective in parallel with observing national regulations and 
guidelines with regard to Individual Development Plans (IUP), written assessments, 
national tests and grading. The course includes practice in reviewing and constructing 
learning situations, assessment situations and examinations on the basis of current 
intended learning outcomes and knowledge requirements with respect to the ethical 
dilemmas that may appear at assessment and grading. Assessment situations and 
examinations are also put in relation to research on distinctions between formative and 
summative assessments. Research illustrating gender and diversity issues in connection 
with assessment and grading is also discussed. 
 
The course discusses the principles of systematic quality work on a scientific basis. 
Terms in focus are for instance documentation, follow-up, evaluation, development, 
compilation and analysis, and assessment of different bases. The systematic quality 
work is seen from the individual, group, organisational and social perspective, as well 
as on the basis of collegial cooperation and learning. The link to the professional 
practice is strengthened through work-integrated learning. 
 
Professional Basis and Professional Progression 
Students are trained in being able to assess the activities in extended schools. Students 
shall in addition acquire knowledge of how pupils' knowledge development is 
documented and graded in the practical aesthetic subject which the student will be 
qualified to teach. Systematic quality work is included in the extended school and 
school activities. Assessment as well as being able to carry out systematic quality work 
are considered important parts of teaching and these areas are thus considered 
significant elements of a teacher's professional competence. The link to the professional 
practice is strengthened through work-integrated learning. 
 
Scientific Approach and Scientific Progression 
The course is aimed at providing the students with a basic knowledge of scientific 
methods, qualitative as well as quantitative, for collection of data. During the course, 
students develop their knowledge in and ability to choose the relevant method for data 
collection, as well as an understanding of how the choice of documentation method and 
theoretical perspecive affects what is emphasized. Students are trained in scientific 
analysis, evaluation, assessment and in being able to systematically document, process, 
communicate and critically review observations made. The course also includes critical 
reviews of current research on grades, assessment, evaluation and systematic quality 
work.

Type of Instruction
Teaching is conducted in the form of lectures, seminars and workshops linked to the 
work-integrated learning elements. The forms of instruction support the development of 
professional communicative skills as well as critical and democratic competence. By 
the use of descriptions, presentations, analyses and critical questions, students are 
provided with the readiness to process the course content in relation to the activities and 
professional practices for which the education is intended. One day of field studies is 
included in the course, focused on assessment, grading and quality work.

Examination
The course is assessed with the grades Fail (U), Pass (G) or Pass with Distinction (VG). 
 



Students' development of knowledge and learning is expressed though written as well 
as verbal communication. Knowledge, understanding, skills and abilities are 
continuously tested on the basis of the educational objectives. Examination is carried 
out through written examinations and oral presentations. Irrespective of examination 
method, it is the individual student's performances that are assessed and graded. A more 
detailed specification of the examination methods and the assessment criteria is given in 
the study guide. In order to receive the grade of Pass, the course objectives must be 
fulfilled.

Course Evaluation
Course evaluations are regularly carried out during the course, verbally as well as in 
writing. After completing the course, an evaluation is carried out in writing. The results 
are compiled and filed at the department in question and are then presented to the 
students who have completed the course. The results together with any measures taken 
are also presented to the students at the following course date.
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